

RECEIVED & FILED
MASON CO. CLERK

2021 AUG 12 P 3:38

SUPERIOR COURT OF WA.
SHARON K. FOGD

BY AP7 DEPUTY

- EXPEDITE
- No hearing set
- Hearing is set

Date: _____

Time: _____

Judge/Calendar: _____

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF WASHINGTON
IN AND FOR MASON COUNTY
FAMILY AND JUVENILE COURT

In Re the Guardianship of:

No. 21-4-00040-23

VIRGINIA L. JACKSON,

DECLARATION OF ATTORNEY'S FEES

Incapacitated Person/Respondent.

HEIDI RAEDEL MAGARO certifies and declares under penalty of perjury as follows:

1. I am the attorney for Virginia L. Jackson (the Respondent), and make this *Declaration* based on my own personal knowledge. I am competent to testify as to the facts stated herein.

2. I have been in private practice since 2013, practicing primarily in the area of guardianship, estate planning and probate, and have typically billed my time on this file at the hourly rate of \$230.00.

3. The firm of LIFETIME LEGAL, PLLC was appointed by the court for the Respondent on April 2, 2021.

4. Attached hereto is an itemization of all of the time that the firm of LIFETIME LEGAL, PLLC, has spent with this matter since June 23, 2021. Total billable attorney and paralegal time expended during this time period, inclusive of the hearing scheduled for August 25, 2021, is 13.9 hours, totaling \$2,830.00 in fees. Notwithstanding, 6.5 hours of the total time expended during this time period in the amount of

21-4-00040-23
DCLR 63
Declaration Affidavit
10834119



Declaration of Attorney's Fees


Page 1

LIFETIME LEGAL, PLLC
Attorneys at Law
1235 Fourth Avenue East, Suite 200
Olympia, Washington 98506
Telephone (360) 754-1976 Fax (360) 943-4427

63

1 \$1,208.00 were courtesy-no-charged. There were no costs during this period. We are requesting approval
2 of total fees in the amount of \$1,622.00.

3 5. I certify that the above time charges were reasonable and necessary in this guardianship action.

4
5 
6 HEIDI RAEDEL MAGARO, WSBA #41499
7 Attorney for Respondent
8 Dated 8/11/21
9 Signed at Olympia, Washington

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Activities Export

08/11/2021

4:02 PM

Date	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Review email correspondence from guardian's attorney and respond regarding same. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.20h	230.00	-	46.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Courtesy No Charge: Draft Declaration of Attorney's Fees. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.20h	160.00	32.00	0.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Draft Notice of Hearing; Declaration of Mailing; Proposed Cover Sheet. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.30h	160.00	-	48.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Courtesy No Charge: Create Mason County Notice of Hearing Template ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	1.30h	160.00	208.00	0.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Estimated time to complete all tasks pursuant to statute inclusive of hearing including: Draft correspondence enc pleadings; File all pleadings; Mail copies of the same to all interested parties. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.50h	160.00	-	80.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Estimated time to appear at Zoom hearing scheduled for 8/25/2021. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	1.00h	230.00	-	230.00
08/10/2021	Ⓢ	Courtesy No Charge: Review Declaration of Attorney's Fees. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.10h	230.00	23.00	0.00
					13.90h		\$1,208.00 6.5h	\$1,622.00 7.4h

Activities Export

08/11/2021

4:02 PM

Date	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/10/2021	Ⓜ	Proofread Motion for Order to Withdraw/Proposed Order ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.20h	160.00	-	32.00
08/10/2021	Ⓜ	Courtesy No Charge: Email guardian's attorney requesting response to HRM correspondence. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.10h	160.00	16.00	0.00
08/09/2021	Ⓜ	Draft second motion to withdraw; draft proposed order; give instructions to paralegal regarding next tasks for hearing on August 25. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.30h	230.00	-	69.00
08/04/2021	Ⓜ	Phone call with client regarding guardian's report and motion to withdraw; memo to file regarding same. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.50h	230.00	-	115.00
08/04/2021	Ⓜ	Review status of matter with paralegal and discuss next steps/tasks. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.10h	230.00	-	23.00
08/03/2021	Ⓜ	Review guardian's initial reports; review file for issue of bond, special notice, request for sale of TPP, request for sale of home, request for misc transactions. LM for client regarding same. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	1.50h	230.00	-	345.00

13.90h

\$1,208.00

\$1,622.00

6.5h

7.4h

Activities Export

08/11/2021

4:02 PM

Date	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/03/2021	Ⓜ	Courtesy No Charge: Review Guardian's Report, Budget, Inventory, Petition. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.90h	160.00	144.00	0.00
08/02/2021	Ⓜ	Courtesy No Charge: Review documents received by guardian; Organize all; Make Guardianship Pleading Log; Print recent correspondence re matter. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	1.50h	160.00	240.00	0.00
07/23/2021	Ⓜ	Review correspondence from guardian's attorney and respond regarding same. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.10h	230.00	-	23.00
07/22/2021	Ⓜ	Phone call with client to discuss room situation; memo to file; email correspondence to guardian's attorney regarding same. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.70h	230.00	-	161.00
07/21/2021	Ⓜ	Phone call to Alpine Way regarding room. ● Unbilled	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.20h	230.00	-	46.00
07/13/2021	Ⓜ	Go to Mason County Superior Court Clerk's office to file Receipt ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Lauren Hansen	0.20h	180.00	-	36.00
07/08/2021	Ⓜ	Receive phone call from guardian's new attorney; review and respond to email correspondence from client's daughter regarding	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.30h	230.00	-	69.00
					13.90h		\$1,208.00 6.5h	\$1,022.00 7.4h

Activities Export

08/11/2021

4:02 PM

Date	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		guardianship status. ○ Billed invoice 44375						
07/07/2021	Ⓜ	Courtesy No Charge: Review status of matter with legal assistant. ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.10h	230.00	23.00	
07/06/2021	Ⓜ	Review and respond to email correspondence from client's daughter. ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.10h	230.00	-	23.00
07/06/2021	Ⓜ	Draft email correspondence to client's daughter regarding update of guardian and facility status. ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.30h	230.00	-	69.00
07/02/2021	Ⓜ	Phone call with client regarding guardian's intention to remain as guardian; request paralegal to fax order appointing guardian to Alpine Way; telephone call with Alpine Way Senior Living confirming living arrangements; memo to file regarding same and request for Alpine to contact me with future changes. ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.80h	230.00	-	184.00
07/01/2021	Ⓜ	Courtesy No Charge: Draft Receipt for Attorney's Fees. ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Casey deVenecia	0.10h	160.00	16.00	0.00
06/30/2021	Ⓜ	Review status of matter with	Jackson, Virginia L. GP -	Heidi	0.10h	230.00	-	23.00
					13.90h		\$1,208.00 6.5h	\$1,622.00 7.4h

Activities Export

08/11/2021
4:02 PM

Date	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		paralegal. Draft email correspondence to GAL. ○ Billed invoice 44375	H11337 Guardianship	Raedel Magaro				
06/23/2021	①	Courtesy No Charge: Follow up phone conference with client regarding guardian's intent to resign and preferences for successor guardian (her daughter). (.4) Phone call with guardian's daughter regarding next steps and to inquire whether daughter may be willing and able to serve as guardian (1.0). Draft email correspondence to former GAL regarding regarding-appointment. (.1) ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	1.50h	230.00	345.00	
06/23/2021	①	Courtesy No Charge: Review pleadings and attendance at zoom hearing (already included in attorney fee declaration filed with the court on 6-22-2021). ○ Billed invoice 44375	Jackson, Virginia L. GP - H11337 Guardianship	Heidi Raedel Magaro	0.70h	230.00	161.00	
					13.90h		\$1,208.00 6.5h	\$1,622.00 7.4h